NEW CASTLE COUNTY
VOCATIONAL TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

W

1417 NEWPORT ROAD, WILMINGTON, OELAWARE 19804
(302) 995-8000

JOHN F. LYNCH JR. VICTORIA C. GEHRT, Ed.D. YVETTE SANTIAGO
President Superintendent Vice President
Board of Education Board of Education
July 23, 2013
TO: Advanced Student Transportation, Inc.
1400 First State Blvd.

Wilmington, DE 19804
Attn: Mr. Darrall Mosley

SUBJECT: Bid #13-02 Athletic Buses, Bid #13-03 Activity Buses & Bid #13-04 Howard
Inter City Bus Route

DEAR SIR:

The Board of Education of the New Castle County Vo-Tech School District has reviewed the
bids submitted for the above referenced. The awards have been made as per the enclosed
attachment.

We wish to thank you for your competitive bid and look forward to your continued service.
State of Delaware Purchase Orders will be issued and processed for the bus services needed to
complete the above mentioned projects. The Purchase Order Numbers must be listed on all
invoices submitted to us.

R eﬂf\ectfullv

Original on File

Jason 8. Hale, Ed.D., CPA,
D‘i\req:tor of Business

JH:chm
Attachment

M

The New Castle County Vocational Tachnical School District is an equal opportunity employer and does not
discriminate or deny services on the basis of race, color, religion, national origln, gender, sexual orlentation,
marital status, age, disability or covered veteran statug in employment.



NEW CASTLE COUNTY VOCATIONAL-TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

June 19, 2013

MEMORANDUM TO: Jason Hale
FROM: Mark E. Wilson Original én File
SUBJECT: BD #13-02 - Athletic Buses

Bids were submitted to the following: (*denotss respondent}

*Advanced Student
Boulden Bus Co.
* First Student

Knotts, Inc.
* Staplefords

The Bids are as follows:

DELCASTLE FIRST STUDENT ADVANCED STAPLEFORDS
Zone [ Rate $133.00 $149.0C N’A
Zone 11 Rate
Drive Time 63.00 per hour 51.00C per hour N/A
Layover 21.00 per hour 26.0G per hour N/A
HODGSON
Zone [Rate $152.00 $145.00 N/A
Zoue II Rate
Drive Time 52.00 per hour 51.00 per hour N/A
Layover 26.00 per hour 25.00 per hour N/A
HOWARD
Zone [ Rate $152.00 $149.00 N/A
Zone I Rate
Drive Time 68.00 per hour 51.00 per hour N/A
Layover 26.00 per hour 26.00 per hour NrA
ST GEORGES
Zone [ Rate $165.06 $149.00 $143.00
Zone [l Rate
Drive Time 56.00 per hour 51.00 per hour 50.00 per hour
Layover 26.00 per hour 26.00 per hour 24 .45 per hour

Recommend Bid 13-02 to fow bidder First Student for Delcastle, Advanced Student for Hodgson and Howard
and Staplefords for St. Georges. Since St Georges does not do out of state transportation, these trips would be
handled by Advanced Student. This bid may be renewed for three additional years through negotiation with
the contractor and New Castle County Vocational Technical School District.

MEW/sg
pc: Chris Massey



NEW CASTLE COUNTY VOCATIONAL-TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

June 19, 2013
MEMORANDUM TQ: Jason Hale Original on File
FROM: Mark E. Wilson
—
SUBJECT: BID #13-03 Activity Buses /
Bids were submitted to the following: (*denotes respondent)
*Advanced Student Knetts, Inc.
Boulden Bus Company *Staplefords
*First Student
The Bids are as follows:
Advanced Student Transportation 47.00 per hour for each bus (Delcastle)
47.00 per hour for each bus (Howard)
51.00 per hour for each bus (Hodgson)
(withdrawn on 6/17/13)  51.00 per hour for each bus (St Georges)
First Student 43,00 per hour for each bus (Delcastle)
48.00 per hour for each bus (Howard})
53.00 per hour for each bus (Hodgson)
57.00 per hour for each bus (St Georges)
Staplefords No bid (Delcastle)
No Bid (Howard)
No bid (Hodgson)

53.00 per hour for each bus (St Georges)

Delcastle High School 6
Hodgson Vo-Tech 5
Howard High School 4
St Georges High School 5

Recommend Bid 10-03 to low bidder Advanced Student for Delcastle, Howard and Hodgson and Staplefords
for St. Georges. This bid may be renewed for three additional years through negotiation between the
contractor and New Castle County Vocational Technical School District.

MEW/sg

pc: Chris Massey



NEW CASTLE COUNTY VOCATIONAL-TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

June 19, 2013

Original on File

MEMORANDLUM TO: Jason Hale
P
FROM: Mark E. Wilsen
SUBJECT: BID #13-04 Inter-City Bus Route - Howard High Schoel

Bids were submitted te the following: (*denotes respondent)

* Advanced Student Transportation Knotts, [nc.
Boulden Bus Service Staplefords
*First Student

The Bids are as follows:

Advanced Student Transportation $149.00 per bus per day
First Student $175.00 per bus per day

Recommend Bid 13-04 to low bidder Advanced Student Transportation. This bid may be renewed for three
additional years through negotiation between the contractor and New Castle County Vocational Technical
School District.

MEW/sg

pe: Chris Massey



NEW CASTLE COUNTY
VOCATIONAL TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

EemEemrmms—— =g e e e e e e N I ey e

1417 NEWPORT ROAD, WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19804
(302) 995-8000

JOHN F. LYNCH JR. VICTORIA C. GEHRT, £d.D YVETTE SANTIAGO
Presidemt Superintendent Vica President
Board of Educaticn Board of Education

July 23,2013

TO: First Student, Inc.
750 Stanton Christiana Road
Newark, DE 19713
Attn: Mr. Reginald Henry

SUBJECT: Bid #13-02 Athletic Buses & Bid #13-035 Delcastle/Marshallton Shuttle Service

DEAR SIR:

The Board of Education of the New Castle County Vo-Tech School District has reviewed the
bids submitted for the above referenced. The awards have been made as per the enclosed
attachment.

We wish to thank you for your competitive bid and look forward to your continued service.
State of Delaware Purchase Orders will be issued and processed for the bus services needed to
complete the above mentioned projects. The Purchase Order Numbers must be listed on all
invoices submitted to us.

R acnantfalls:

Original on File

Jadod S. Hale, Ed.D., CPA,
Dﬂr tor of Business

JH:chm
Attachment

IR S TS TR T SR AT T SR SN S AN s S T ws s e LT R e e P e R L T T

The New Castle County Vocational Technical Schoal District is an aqual opportunity amployer and does not
discriminate or deny services on the basis of race, color, religion, national arigin, gender, sexual orietation,
marftal status, age, disability or covered veteran status in employment.



NEW CASTLE COUNTY VOCATIONAL-TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

June 19, 2013
MEMORANDUM TO: Jason Hale
FROM: Mark E. Wilson Original {)n File
SUBJECT: BID #13-02 - Athletic Buses ! -

Bids were submitted to the following: (*denotes respondent)
* Advanced Student Knotts, Inc.
Boulden Bus Co. * Staplefords
* First Student

The Bids are as follows:

DELCASTLE FIRST STUDENT ADVANCED
Zone [ Rate $133.00 $149.00
Zone [ Rate
Drive Time 63.00 per hour 51.0GC per hour
Layover 21.00 per hour 26.00 per hour
HODGSON
Zone [ Rate $152.00 $145.00
Zoue 11 Rate
Drive Time 52.00 per hour 51.00 per hour
Layover 26,00 per hour 26.00 per hour
HOWARD
Zone I Rate $152.00 $149.00
Zoue II Rate
Drve Time 68.00 per hour 51.00 per hour
Lavover 26.00 per hour 26.00 per hour
ST GEORGES
Zone [ Rate $165.00 $149.00
Zone [I Rate
Drive Time 56.00 per hour 51.00 per hour
Layover 26.00 per hour 26.00 per hour

STAPLEFORDS
N/A

N/A
N/A

N/A

N/A
iA

N/A

N/A
N/A

$143.00

50.00 per hour
24 45 per hour

Recommend Bid 13-02 to low bidder First Student for Delcastle, Advanced Student for Hodgson and Howard
and Staplefords for St. Georges. Since St Georges does not do out of state transportation, these trips would be
handled by Advanced Student. This bid may be renewed for three additional years through negotiation with

the contractor and New Castle County Vocational Technical School District.

MEW/sg

pc: Chris Massey



NEW CASTLE COUNTY VOCATIONAL-TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

June 19, 2013

MEMORANDUM TO: msentiale  Original on File
FROM: vlark E. Wilson
SUBJECT: BID #13-05 Shuttle Service - Delcastle/Marshallton
Bids were submitted to the following: (*denotes respondent)

* Advanced Student Transportation Knotts, fnc.

Boulden Bus Service Staplefords

* Firgt Student
The Bids are as follows:

Advanced Student $375.00 perday x 178 days = $66,750.00

First Student $263.00 per day x 178 days = $46,814.00

Recommend Bid 13-05 to low Bidder First Student with a total of $46,814.00. This bid may be renewed for
three additional years through negotiation between the contractor and New Castle County Vocational
Technical School District.

MEW/sg

pc: Chris Massey



NEW CASTLE COUNTY
VOCATIONAL TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

G CERTEESTY 4SS s A Ty L I AR e e e S e S s ST T I S S R S Y T

1417 NEWPORT ROAD, WILMINGTON, DELAWARE 19804
(302) 995-8000

JOHN F. LYNCH JR. VICTORIA C. GEHRT, Ed.D. YVETTE SANTIAGO
President Superintendent Vice President
Board of Education Board of Education
July 23,2013
TO: Staplefords Chevrolet
PO Box 68

1402 S. DuPont Highway
St. Georges, DE 19733
Attn: Mr. Richard B. Stapleford

SUBJECT: Bid #13-02 Athletic Buses & Bid #13-03 Activity Buses

DEAR SIR:

The Board of Education of the New Castle County Vo-Tech School District has reviewed the
bids submitted for the above referenced. The awards have been made as per the enclosed
attachment.

We wish to thank you for your competitive bid and look forward to your continued service.
State of Delaware Purchase Orders will be issued and processed for the bus services needed to
complete the above mentioned projects. The Purchase Order Numbers must be listed on all
invoices submitted to us.

Respectfullv.

Original on File

Jg sot S. Hale, Ed.D., CPA,
Direc¢tor of Business

JH:chm
Attachment

A s e e P e T TS AT MRS LT T i wa U T W L R et +o it S S SRAT o e ST

The New Castle County Vocational Technical School District is an equal opportunity employer and does not
discriminate ar deny services on the basis of race, color, religion, national arigin, gender, sexual orientation,
marital status, age, disability ar covered veteran status in employment.



NEW CASTLE COUNTY VOCATIONAL-TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

MEMORANDUM TO:

FROM:
SUBJECT:

Jason Hale
Mark E. Wilson

BID #13-02 - Athletic Buses

Bids were submitted to the following: (*denotes respondent)

*Advanced Student
Boulden Bus Co.
* First Student

The Bids are as follows:

DELCASTLE

Zone [ Rate
Zone [ Rate
Drive Time
Layover

HODGSON

Zoune  Rate

Zone II Rate
Drive Time
Layover

HOWARD

Zone I Rate

Zone I1 Rate
Drive Time
Layover

ST GEORGES

Zone I Rate

Zone K Rate
Drive Time
Layover

FIRST STUDENT
§133.00

63.00 per hour
21.00 per hour

$152.00

52.00 per hour
26.00 per hour

$152.00

68.00 per hour
26.00 per hour

$165.00

56.00 per hour
26.00 per hour

June 19, 2013

/
QOriginal on File

Knootts, Inc.
* Staplefords

ADVANCED
$149.06

51.6G per hour
26.00 per hour

$149.00

51.00 per hour
26.00 per hour

$149.00

51.00 per hour
26.00 per hour

$149.00

51.00 per hour
24.00 per hour

STAPLEFORDS

N/A

N/A
N/A

N/A

N/A
N/A

$143.00

50.00 per hour
24.45 per hour

Recommend Bid 13-02 to low bidder First Student for Delcastle, Advanced Student for Hodgson and Howard
and Staplefords for St. Georges. Since St Georges does not do out of state transportation, these trips would be
handled by Advanced Student. This bid may be renewed for three additional years through negotiation with
the contractor and New Castle County Vocational Technical School District.

MEW/sg

pc: Chris Massey



NEW CASTLE COUNTY VOCATIONAL-TECHNICAL SCHOOL DISTRICT

June 19, 2013

MEMORANDUM TO- Jason Hale
FROM: Mark E. Wilson Original on File
—
SUBJECT: BID #13-03 Activity Buses /
Bids were submitted tc the following: {*denotes respondent)
*Advanced Student Knotts, Inc.
Boulden Bus Company *Staplefords
*First Student
The Bids are as follows:
Advanced Student Transportation 47.00 per hour for each bus (Delcastle)

47.00 per hour for sach bus (Howard)
51.00 per hour for each bus (Hodgson)
(withdrawn on 6/17/13)  51.00 per hour for each bus (St Georges)

First Student 48.00 per hour for each bus (Delcastle)
48.00 per hour for each bus (Howard)
53.00 per hour for each bus (Hodgson)
57.00 per hour for each bus (St Georges)

Staplefords No bid (Delcastle)
No Bid (Howard)
No bid (Hodgson)
53.00 per hour for cach bus (St Georges)

Delcastle High School 6
Hodgson Vo-Tech 5
Howard High School 4
St Georges High School 5

Recommend Bid 10-03 to low bidder Advanced Student for Delcastle, Howard and Hodgson and Staplefords
for St. Georges. This bid may be rencwed for three additional years through negotiation between the
contractor and New Castle County Vocational Technical School District.

MEW/sg

pc: Chris Massey



