PROFESSIONAL UNIFORMS FOR OTHER AGENCIES

GSS10070-CLOTHING
Part 1 - Section 8

COMPANY NAME: Graves Uniforms
CONTACT NAME: Terry Havens
PHONE NUMBER: 800-441-8010
EMAIL ADDRESS: info@gravesuniforms.com
BRAND DELIVERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE NAME NUMBER UNIT PRICE IN STOCK IN DAYS
1|TROUSERS - MEN - 65% Dacron/35% Rayon gabardine weave 13-1/2|28-42 Fechheimer 47300 $52.95 No 30 Days
oz./linear yard. Plain front, 2 quarter top front pockets, 2 hip pocket, 44-50 Fechheimer 47300 $58.25 No 30 Days
straight legs, 3/4" belt loops. Optional 1/2" and 1" leg strips. Colors: 52-54 Fechheimer 47300 $63.50 No 30 Days
Navy Blue, Forest Green. 28-40 SHORT RISE Fechheimer 47300 $52.95 No 30 Days
32-42 LONG RISE Fechheimer 47300 $52.95 No 30 Days
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2" Fechheimer Braid $9.00 No 30 Days
1" Fechheimer Braid $10.00 No 30 Days
112" Fechheimer Braid $13.00 No 30 Days
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2" Fechheimer Braid $9.00 No 30 Days
1" Fechheimer Braid $10.00 No 30 Days
112" Fechheimer Braid $13.00 No 30 Days
2|TROUSERS - MEN - 100% Texturized polyester serge weave 11.75 28-42 Fechheimer 38200 $37.90 Yes 15 Days
oz./linear yard. Peak lapels, 5 button, plain front with box pleated patch |44-50 Fechheimer 38200 $41.70 Yes 15 Days
pockets, flaps, shoulder straps and badge tab. 52-54 Fechheimer 38200 $45.50 Yes 15 Days
32-42 LONG RISE Fechheimer 38200 $37.90 Yes 15 Days
28-40 SHORT RISE Fechheimer 38200 $37.90 Yes 15 Days
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2" Fechheimer Braid $9.00 Yes 15 Days
1" Fechheimer Braid $10.00 Yes 15 Days
11/2" Fechheimer Braid $13.00 Yes 15 Days
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2" Fechheimer Braid $9.00 Yes 15 Days
1" Fechheimer Braid $10.00 Yes 15 Days
11/2" Fechheimer Braid $13.00 Yes 15 Days
3|TROUSERS - MEN - 7-3/4 0z., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton
twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset
pockets, inseam up to 36 inches. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
28-42 Dickies PT32 Series $21.75 No 30 Days
44-54 Dickies PT32 Series $25.85 Size 56 to 60 30 Days
56-60 Dickies PT32 Series $50.25 CUSTOM 30 Days
4|TROUSERS - WOMEN — 100% texturized polyester serge weave
11.75 oz./linear yard. Plain front with darts above hip pockets, straignt |6-18 Fechheimer 38233 $37.90 Yes 15 Days
legs, 3/4" belt loops. Optional 1/2" and 1" leg strips. Color: Navy Blue.
20-24 Fechheimer 38233 $41.70 Yes 15 Days
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2" Fechheimer Braid $9.00 Yes 15 Days
1" Fechheimer Braid $10.00 Yes 15 Days
11/2" Fechheimer Braid $13.00 Yes 15 Days
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2" Fechheimer Braid $9.00 Yes 15 Days
1" Fechheimer Braid $10.00 Yes 15 Days
11/2" Fechheimer Braid $13.00 Yes 15 Days
5|TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed
cotton twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four
inset pockets, inseam up to 36 inches. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
2-28 NO AWARD
6|TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed
cotton blend or brushed. Double pleated front. Four inset pockets, two
in front, two in rear. Four inch elastic inserts on each side of
waistband. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki. Dickies PT55 Series $30.25 No 30 Days
2-28 BLACK ONLY
7|TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed Redkap [ PT61 | $23.85 [ No | 30Days
cotton blend or brushed. Plain front. Four inset pockets, two in front, |2-28 Navy (4-28), Black (4-24), Charcoal & Khaki (4-22), White (4-26)
8|TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed
cotton blend or brushed. Belt loops, four inset pockets, two in front, two
in rear. Four inch elastic inserts on each side of waistband. Colors:
Navy Blue, Khaki. Dickies PT55 Series $30.25 No 30 Days
2-28 BLACK ONLY
9[SHORTS - MEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton twill. |28-42 Edwards 2410 Series $22.50 No 30 Days
Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset 44-54 Edwards 2410 Series $27.00 Size 56 to 60 30 Days
pockets. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki. 56-60 Edwards 2410 Series $44.25 CUSTOM 30 Days
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10|SHORTS - MEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton twill.
Solid waistband with belt loops Plain front. Four inset pockets. Colors: [28-42 Red Kap PT26 Series $13.25 No 30 Days
Navy Blue, Khaki. 44-50 Red Kap PT26 Series $15.90 Size 56 to 60 30 Days
52-60 Red Kap PT26 Series $26.50 CUSTOM 30 Days
11|{SHORTS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton
twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset
pockets. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki. 2-28 Edwards 8410 Series $26.00 No 30 Days
12|SKIRT - 100% texturized polyester serge weave 11.75 oz./linear yard. i
Slightly flared, 2 side pockets, 4 darts, 3/4" belt loops. Color: Navy 6-18 Fechheimer 38033 $44.75 No 30 Days
Blue. 20-24 Fechheimer 38033 $49.00 No 30 Days
13|SHIRTS - 65% Dacron polyester/35% cotton. 2 pockets wi/flaps, badge
tab, 2 shoulder epaulets.
13A
Male Long Sleeve - P877-3 white, P878-3 blue or approved equal. 14-20 Elbeco P870 Series $37.00 Yes 15 Days
13B
Male Short Sleeve - P867-3 white, P868-3 blue or approved equal. 14-20 Elbeco P860 Series $36.00 Yes 15 Days
13C
Female Long Sleeve - P801-3 white, P802-3 blue or approved equal. |32-48 Elbeco P800 Series $37.00 Yes 15 Days
13D
Female Short Sleeve - P811-3 white, P812-3 blue or approved equal. [32-48 Elbeco P810 Series $36.00 Yes 15 Days
14|SHIRTS - 100% polyester. 2 pockets with flaps, badge tab, 2 shoulder
epaulets. Shirts can be ordered with contrasting pocket flaps and/or
contrasting epaulets. Epaulets not available on navy blue shirt. Colors:
White, Grey, Silvertan, Blue, Navy Blue, French Blue.
14A|Male Long Sleeve - 300 Series or approved equal. 14-20 Elbeco 300 Series $38.00 Yes 15 Days
14-20 X LONG TAIL Elbeco 300 Series $53.00 No 30 Days
CNTRST PCKTS Elbeco $46.00 No 30 Days
14B|Male Short Sleeve - 3300 Series or approved equal. 14-20 Elbeco 3300 Series $35.75 Yes 15 Days
14-20 X LONG TAIL Elbeco 3300 Series $44.75 No 30 Days
CNTRST PCKTS Elbeco $43.75 No 30 Days
14C|Female Long Sleeve - 9300 Series or approved equal. 38-48 Elbeco 9300 Series $42.50 Yes 15 Days
CNTRST PCKTS Elbeco $46.00 No 30 Days
14D|Female Short Sleeve - 9800 Series or approved equal. 38-48 Elbeco 9800 Series $35.75 Yes 15 Days
CNTRST PCKTS Elbeco $43.75 No 30 Days
15|SHIRTS - 65% polyester/35% rayon tropical weave, 2 pockets with
flaps, badge tab, 2 shoulder epaulets. Shirts can be ordered with
contrasting pocket flaps and/or contrasting epaulets. Epaulets not
available on navy blue shirt. Long sleeve shirts may be special ordered
with banjo elbows. Colors: White, Grey, Silvertan, Blue, Navy Blue,
French Blue, Brown.
15A |Male Long Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET
15B |Male Short Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET
15C |Female Long Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET
15D |Female Short Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET NO AWARD
16|SHIRT - Men - Short sleeve, with buttons, durable press, 65% SXL
polyester, 35% cotton broadcloth, 2 pockets. Color: White. -
2XL-3XL NO BID
17|SHIRT - WOMEN - Dress, long sleeve, Cook, 65% polyester, 35%
cotton. Color: White. S-XL Red Kap SP13WH $16.95 No 30 Days
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18|GOLF SHIRTS - LONG SLEEVE - Unisex - 7 0z., 50% cotton, 50% XS-XL
polyester. One pocket on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve is to
have three inch cuff. Colors: Lt. Blue, Navy Blue, Tan. 2XL-3XL
4XL-5XL NO BID
19|GOLF SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE - Unisex - 7 0z., 50% cotton, 50%
polyester. One pocket on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve to be XS-XL
hemmed. Colors: Lt. Blue, Navy Blue, Tan, Royal Blue. 2XL-3XL
4XL-5XL NO BID
20{GOLF SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE - Unisex -100% cotton. One pocket SMXL
on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve to be hemmed. Colors:
Navy, Royal Blue. 2XL-3XL NO BID
21|BLAZER - MEN - Two button, single breasted, soft shoulder, plain back
with center vent, metal button. 38-48
50-56 NO AWARD
22|CARDIGAN SWEATER - V NECK - 100% no pile acrylic yarn, jersey XS-L
knit fabric, two lower pockets, ribbed waist and cuff. Five button
closure. Color: Navy Blue. XL-2XL
3XL-4XL NO BID
23|EISENHOWER JACKET - MEN - 100% Texturized polyester serge 34-36 REG Fechheimer 38169 $125.50 Yes 30 Days
weave 11.75 oz./linear yard. Peak lapels, 5 button, plain front with box |38-52 REG Fechheimer 38169 $137.50 Yes 30 Days
pleated patch pockets, flaps, shoulder straps and badge tab. Color: 36-50 LONG Fechheimer 38169 $137.50 Yes 30 Days
Navy Blue. 34-46 XLONG Fechheimer 38169 $169.50 No - Custom 8 -10 Weeks
24|(COAT - LADIES - 100% Texturized polyester serge weave 11.75
oz./linear yard. 4-button, single breasted straight front, notched lapels, |6-18 Fechheimer 38833 $125.50 Yes 15 Days
shoulder straps. Color: Navy Blue.
20-24 Fechheimer 38833 $137.50 Yes 15 Days
25|TOPPER - WOMEN - Below the hip length, 65% polyester, 35% cotton
with buttons long pointed collar with notched lapel darted bodice and
back, edge stitching enhanced front color, sleeve hems and two slant- SXL Redlkap iliZ23LE $18.05 O SOIBayS
top lower pockets. Color: White.
2XL-3XL Red Kap TP23LB $19.50 No 30 Days
26|REVERSIBLE/REFLECTIVE WINDBREAKER - Two-ply 100% nylon
taffeta with reversible bright orange inside shell. Orange side has 1-  |XS-XL REG
1/2" reflective strips. Zippered front, patch pockets, badge tab, elastic XS-XL LONG
waistband. Colors: Navy/Orange, Black/Orange. =
XXL LONG NO AWARD
27|COAT- 70 denier nylon. Filling: 3 ply denier nylon. Weight: 3.6 oz. Per |S -3XL REG Fechheimer 78140 $265.00 No 30 Days
square yard, weave: plain tear for strength. Gore-Tex liner. Color: Navy|S-3XL SHORT Fechheimer 78140 $265.00 No 30 Days
Blue. S- 3XL LONG Fechheimer 78140 $265.00 No 30 Days
28|CRUISER JACKET WITH GORE-TEX FABRIC — Nylon shell, waist SM-XL Blauer 9010Z $286.00 Yes 15 Days
length, single breasted, waterproofed with Gore-Tex. Zip outer liner. 2XL-3XL Blauer 9010Z $286.00 Yes 15 Days
Colors: Police Blue, Black, Brown, O.D. Green. AXL Black and 90102 $370.00 Yes 15 Days
M-3XL TALL Navy Only 9010Z $286.00 Yes 15 Days
BLACK AND NAVY ONLY
29 BOMBER JACKET (MEN ANP WOMEN) — Tas'lan nylon outer shell, MEDIUM B 6115 $139.00 Yes 15 Days
zip-out full sleeve, thinsulate liner, detachable pile collar, epaulets,
badge tab, knit wristlits and knit waistband, 2 front pockets, zippered |[LARGE Blauer 6115 $139.00 Yes 15 Days
10" side vents with snap closure. State buttons to be furnished and :
sewn on by vendor. Color: Navy. XL Blauer 6115 $139.00 Yes 15 Days
2XL-4XL Blauer 6115 $179.50 Yes 15 Days
30|JACKET - PILE LINED - UNISEX - Nylon Dupont type 66 Taffeta Shell.
Raglan sleeves, two lower side pockets, drawstring. Machine S-L
washable. Color: Navy Blue.
XL-2XL NO BID
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BRAND DELIVERY
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31|{JACKET - Flannel Lined - Unisex - Nylon Dupont type 66 Taffeta Shell.
Raglan sleeves, two lower side pockets, drawstring waist. Jacket has S
gathered sleeve, six (6) snap closures that match shell fabric. Machine
washable. Color: Navy Blue.
XL-3XL NO BID
32|NECKWEAR - 100% polyester. Colors: French Blue, Black, Police CLIP ON STD S. Broome 90010 $3.75 Yes 15 Days
Blue, Brown, 3" wide. CLIP ON XLONG S. Broome 90043 $3.75 Yes 15 Days
14" SHORT S. Broome 90051 $3.75 No 30 Days
4 IN HAND STND S. Broome 90072 $3.75 Yes 15 Days
4 IN HAND XLONG S. Broome 90078 $3.75 Yes 15 Days
CROSS OVER
W/BUTTON SNAP S. Broome 90156 $3.75 Yes 15 Days
33|BELTS - 100% cowhide leather. Plain garrison with solid brass or 28-42 Boston 6605 $11.50 Yes 15 Days
chrome snap on removable buckle. 1-3/4" width. Colors: Black, Brown.
44-50 Boston 6605 $13.50 Yes 15 Days
52-60 Boston 6605 $16.50 Yes 15 Days
34|CAMPAIGN STYLE — Winter fur, felt with chin strap and rain cover.
|Co|or: Navy. 61/2-77/8 | Alboum | ALF40NV | $105.00 Yes 15 Days
35|CAMPAIGN STYLE — Summer triple milian straw with leather bank,
chin strap and rain cover. Color: Navy. ALS40NV
61/2-77/8 Alboum Triple $89.00 Yes 15 Days
36(BALL CAP - SUMMER - 3-6 gold insignias on front of cap, plastic
mesh backs, solid front, adjustable size. Letters should be 2". Letters |3-4 LETTERS Otto 31-165 $4.50 No 30 Days
may be made smaller if 5-6 letters are ordered, so that all letters will fit
on front of cap. Colors: Black, Navy Blue. 5.6 LETTERS Otto 31-165 $4.50 No 30 Days
37|BALL CAP - WINTER - 3-6 gold insignias on front of cap, solid front
and back, adjustable size. Letters should be 2". Letters may be made [3-4 LETTERS Otto 31-069 $4.95 No 30 Days
smaller if 5-6 letters are ordered, so that all letters will fit on front of
cap. 5-6 LETTERS Otto 31-069 $4.95 No 30 Days
38[CANVAS TOTE - 100% cotton canvas fabric, 1202, two side pockets
between straps, 23-1/4" x 15-1/2" x 5-1/2", with bottom gusset. Two
heavyweight canvas straps. Color: Navy Blue. CANVAS TOTE NO BID
OTHER - Days response time for measurements to an active
agency. 7
Days response time for measurements to an passive
agency. 10
Days delivery of store stock SIZE to an active
agency. 15
Days deliever of factory stock SIZE to an
active/passive agency. 30
Days delivery for oversize . 30
Number of employed on site Tailors. 3
Tailor (s) working hours. 8:00 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.
Ship Non-Stock days ARO. 8-10 Weeks
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PROFESSIONAL UNIFORMS FOR OTHER AGENCIES

COMPANY NAME: Hanover Uniform Company
CONTACT NAME: John Mintz
PHONE NUMBER: 800-541-9709 x 114
EMAIL ADDRESS: jmintz@hanoveruniform.com
BRAND DELIVERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE NAME NUMBER UNIT PRICE IN STOCK IN DAYS
1|TROUSERS - MEN - 65% Dacron/35% Rayon gabardine weave 13-1/2 28-42 fechheimer 32205 $50.00 yes 5
oz./linear yard. Plain front, 2 quarter top front pockets, 2 hip pocket, 44-50 fechheimer 32205 $60.00 yes 5
straight legs, 3/4" belt loops. Optional 1/2" and 1" leg strips. Colors: 52-54 fechheimer 32205 $60.00 yes 5
Navy Blue, Forest Green. 28-40 SHORT RISE fechheimer 32205 $50.00 yes 5)
32-42 LONG RISE fechheimer 32205 $50.00 yes 5)
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2" $7.00
1" $7.00
11/2" $7.00
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2" $7.00
1" $7.00
11/2" $7.00
2|TROUSERS - MEN - 100% Texturized polyester serge weave 11.75 28-42 fechheimer 38233 $40.00 yes 5
oz./linear yard. Peak lapels, 5 button, plain front with box pleated patch 44-50 fechheimer 38233 $48.00 yes 5
pockets, flaps, shoulder straps and badge tab. 52-54 fechheimer 38233 $48.00 yes 5
32-42 LONG RISE fechheimer 38233 $40.00 yes 5
28-40 SHORT RISE fechheimer 38233 $40.00 yes 5
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2" $7.00
1" $7.00
11/2" $7.00
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2" $7.00
1" $7.00
11/2" $7.00
3|TROUSERS - MEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton
twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset
pockets, inseam up to 36 inches. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
28-60 red kap pt32 $16.70 yes 5
5
4|TROUSERS - WOMEN — 100% texturized polyester serge weave
11.75 oz./linear yard. Plain front with darts above hip pockets, straignt 6-18 fechheimer 38233 $40.00 yes 5)
legs, 3/4" belt loops. Optional 1/2" and 1" leg strips. Color: Navy Blue.
20-24 fechheimer 38233 $48.00 yes 5
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2" fechheimer 38233 $7.00 yes 5
1" fechheimer 38233 $7.00 yes 5
11/2" fechheimer 38233 $7.00 yes 5
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2" $7.00 5)
1" $7.00 5
11/2" $7.00 5
5|TROUSERS - WOMEN — 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed
cotton twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four
inset pockets, inseam up to 36 inches. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
2-28 edwards 8610 $16.70 yes 5
5
6| TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed
cotton blend or brushed. Double pleated front. Four inset pockets, two
in front, two in rear. Four inch elastic inserts on each side of
waistband. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
2-28 red kap pcl7 $16.70 yes 5
7|TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed
cotton blend or brushed. Plain front. Four inset pockets, two in front, 2-28 dickies 92-764 $16.70 yes 5
8|TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed
cotton blend or brushed. Belt loops, four inset pockets, two in front, two
in rear. Four inch elastic inserts on each side of waistband. Colors:
Navy Blue, Khaki.
2-28 dickies 92-764 $16.70 yes 5
9[SHORTS - MEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton twill. 28-60 edwards 2410 $14.00 yes 5
Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset
pockets. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
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BRAND DELIVERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE NAME NUMBER UNIT PRICE IN STOCK IN DAYS
10[SHORTS - MEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton twill.
Solid waistband with belt loops Plain front. Four inset pockets. Colors: 28-60 red kap pt26 $14.00 yes 5
Navy Blue, Khaki.
11|SHORTS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton
twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset
pockets. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki. 2-28 edwards 8410 $14.00 yes 5
12|SKIRT - 100% texturized polyester serge weave 11.75 oz./linear yard.
Slightly flared, 2 side pockets, 4 darts, 3/4" belt loops. Color: Navy 6-18
Blue. 20-24 NO AWARD
13|SHIRTS - 65% Dacron polyester/35% cotton. 2 pockets w/flaps, badge
tab, 2 shoulder epaulets.
13A
Male Long Sleeve - P877-3 white, P878-3 blue or approved equal. 14-20 elbeco p877 $35.00 yes 5
13B
Male Short Sleeve - P867-3 white, P868-3 blue or approved equal. 14-20 elbeco p868 $32.00 yes 5
13C
Female Long Sleeve - P801-3 white, P802-3 blue or approved equal. 32-48 elbeco p802 $35.00 yes 5
13D
Female Short Sleeve - P811-3 white, P812-3 blue or approved equal. 32-48 elbeco p812 $32.00 yes 5
yes
14|SHIRTS - 100% polyester. 2 pockets with flaps, badge tab, 2 shoulder
epaulets. Shirts can be ordered with contrasting pocket flaps and/or
contrasting epaulets. Epaulets not available on navy blue shirt. Colors:
White, Grey, Silvertan, Blue, Navy Blue, French Blue.
14A|Male Long Sleeve - 300 Series or approved equal. 14-20 elbeco 300 $40.00 yes 5
14-20 X LONG TAIL elbeco $48.00 yes 5
CNTRST PCKTS elbeco $54.00 yes 5
14B|Male Short Sleeve - 3300 Series or approved equal. 14-20 elbeco 3300 $38.00 yes 5
14-20 X LONG TAIL elbeco $46.00 yes 5
CNTRST PCKTS elbeco $52.00 yes 5
14C|Female Long Sleeve - 9300 Series or approved equal. 38-48 elbeco 9300 $40.00 yes 5
CNTRST PCKTS elbeco $52.00 yes 5
14D|Female Short Sleeve - 9800 Series or approved equal. 38-48 elbeco 9800 $38.00 yes 5
CNTRST PCKTS elbeco $46.00 yes 5
15|SHIRTS - 65% polyester/35% rayon tropical weave, 2 pockets with
flaps, badge tab, 2 shoulder epaulets. Shirts can be ordered with
contrasting pocket flaps and/or contrasting epaulets. Epaulets not
available on navy blue shirt. Long sleeve shirts may be special ordered
with banjo elbows. Colors: White, Grey, Silvertan, Blue, Navy Blue,
French Blue, Brown. 5
15A |Male Long Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20 elbeco 200 $49.00 yes 5
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET elbeco $64.00 yes 5)
15B |Male Short Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20 elbeco 200 $46.00 yes 5
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET elbeco $51.00 yes 5
15C |Female Long Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20 elbeco 200 $49.00 yes 5
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET elbeco $64.00 yes 5
15D |Female Short Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20 elbeco $46.00 yes 5
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET elbeco 200 $51.00 yes 5)
16|SHIRT - Men - Short sleeve, with buttons, durable press, 65%
polyester, 35% cotton broadcloth, 2 pockets. Color:pWhite. SXL tecikap sp28 $15.00 ES D
2XL-3XL red kap $20.00 yes 5
yes
17|SHIRT - WOMEN - Dress, long sleeve, Cook, 65% polyester, 35%
cotton. Color: White. S-XL red kap sp13 $10.00 yes 5
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18|GOLF SHIRTS - LONG SLEEVE - Unisex - 7 0z., 50% cotton, SQ% XS-XL hartwell 5700 $14.95 ves 5
polyester. One pocket on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve is to
have three inch cuff. Colors: Lt. Blue, Navy Blue, Tan. 2XL-3XL hartwell 5700 $17.96 yes 5
4XL-5XL hartwell 5700 $21.05 yes 5
19|GOLF SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE - Unisex - 7 0z., 50% cotton, 50%
polyester. One pocket on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve to be XSXL hartwell 5711 $13.95 yes 5
hemmed. Colors: Lt. Blue, Navy Blue, Tan, Royal Blue. 2XL-3XL hartwell 5711 $16.95 yes 5
AXL-5XL hartwell 5711 $19.96 yes 5)
20|GOLF SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE - Unisex -100% cotton. One pocket
on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve to be hemmed. Colors: SM-XL hartwell 200 $13.95 yes 5
Navy, Royal Blue. 2XL-3XL hartwell 200 $16.95 yes 5
yes
21|BLAZER - MEN - Two button, single breasted, soft shoulder, plain back
with center vent, metal button. 38-48 edwards 3297 $50.00 yes 5
50-56 edwards 3297 $60.00 yes 5
22 CA_RDIG_AN SWEATER -V NEQK - 100% no pile acrylic yarn, jersey XS-L san fransisco $34.00 yes 5
knit fabric, two lower pockets, ribbed waist and cuff. Five button
closure. Color: Navy Blue. XL-2XL san fransisco $42.00 yes
3XL-4XL san fransisco $48.00 yese 5
23|EISENHOWER JACKET - MEN - 100% Texturized polyester serge 34-36 REG fechheimer 38169 $120.00 yes 5
weave 11.75 oz./linear yard. Peak lapels, 5 button, plain front with box 38-52 REG fechheimer 38169 $120.00 yes 5
pleated patch pockets, flaps, shoulder straps and badge tab. Color: 36-50 LONG fechheimer 38169 $120.00 yes 5
Navy Blue. 34-46 XLONG $120.00 5
fechheimer
24|COAT - LADIES - 100% Texturized polyester serge weave 11.75
oz./linear yard. 4-button, single breasted straight front, notched lapels, 6-18 fechheimer 38833 $120.00 yes 5
shoulder straps. Color: Navy Blue.
20-24 fechheimer 38833 $120.00 yes 5
25|TOPPER - WOMEN - Below the hip length, 65% polyester, 35% cotton
with buttons long pointed collar with notched lapel darted bodice and
back, edge stitching enhanced front color, sleeve hems and two slant- SXL redikap tp23 $12.00 Yes 2
top lower pockets. Color: White.
2XL-3XL red kap tp23 $15.00 yes 5
26|REVERSIBLE/REFLECTIVE WINDBREAKER - Two-ply 100% nylon )
taffeta with reversible bright orange inside shell. Orange side has 1- XS-XL REG fechheimer 53160 $40.00 yes 5
1/2" reflective strips. Zippered front, patch pockets, badge tab, elastic .
waistband. Colors: Navy/Orange, Black/Orange. XS-XL LONG fechheimer 53160 $40.00 yes 3
XXL LONG fechheimer 53160 $48.00 yes 5)
27|COAT- 70 denier nylon. Filling: 3 ply denier nylon. Weight: 3.6 oz. Per S -3XL REG fechheimer 78140 $300.00 yes 5
square yard, weave: plain tear for strength. Gore-Tex liner. Color: Navy S-3XL SHORT fechheimer 78140 $300.00 yes 5
Blue. S- 3XL LONG fechheimer 78140 $300.00 yes 5
28|CRUISER JACKET WITH GORE-TEX FABRIC — Nylon shell, waist 36-46 REG blauer 9010Z $300.00 yes 5
length, single breasted, waterproofed with Gore-Tex. Zip outer liner. 48-50 REG blauer 9010Z $300.00 yes 5
Colors: Police Blue, Black, Brown, O.D. Green. 52-58 REG blauer 90102 $330.00 yes 5)
36-46 LONG blauer 9010Z $300.00 yes 5
29 BOMBER JACKET (MEN ANP WOMEN) — Ta§|an nylon outer shell, MEDIUM S 6115 $140.00 ves 5
zip-out full sleeve, thinsulate liner, detachable pile collar, epaulets,
badge tab, knit wristlits and knit waistband, 2 front pockets, zippered LARGE blauer 6115 $140.00 yes 5)
10" side vents with snap closure. State buttons to be furnished and
sewn on by vendor. Color: Navy. XL blauer 6115 $140.00 YES 5
2XL-4XL blauer 6115 $160.00 yes 5
30|JACKET - PILE LINED - UNISEX - Nylon Dupont type 66 Taffeta Shell.
Raglan sleeves, two lower side pockets, drawstring. Machine S-L hilton MP J81 $14.70 yes 5
washable. Color: Navy Blue.
XL-2XL hilton MP J81 $17.40 yes 5
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COMPANY NAME: Hanover Uniform Company
CONTACT NAME: John Mintz
PHONE NUMBER: 800-541-9709 x 114
EMAIL ADDRESS: jmintz@hanoveruniform.com
BRAND DELIVERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE NAME NUMBER UNIT PRICE IN STOCK IN DAYS
31|JACKET - Flannel Lined - Unisex - Nylon Dupont type 66 Taffeta Shell.
Raglan sleeves, two lower side pockets, drawstring waist. Jacket has .
gathered sleeve, six (6) snap closures that match shell fabric. Machine SL hifton MIEIST $14.70 ES 3
washable. Color: Navy Blue.
XL-3XL hilton MLJ81 $17.40 yes 5)
32|NECKWEAR - 100% polyester. Colors: French Blue, Black, Police CLIP ON STD broome 900 $3.00 yes 5
Blue, Brown, 3" wide. CLIP ON XLONG broome 900 $3.25 yes 5
14" SHORT broome 900 $3.50 yes 5)
4 IN HAND STND broome 900 $3.50 yes 5)
4 IN HAND XLONG broome 900 $3.50 yes 5)
CROSS OVER
W/BUTTON SNAP broome 900 $3.00 yes 5
33|BELTS - 100% cowhide leather. Plain garrison with solid brass or 28-42 mark wolf 301 $13.00 yes 5
chrome snap on removable buckle. 1-3/4" width. Colors: Black, Brown. :
44-50 mark wolf 301 $16.00 yes 5
52-60 mark wolf 301 $18.00 yes 5
34|CAMPAIGN STYLE — Winter fur, felt with chin strap and rain cover.
Color: Navy. 61/2-77/8 alboum 3X $62.00 yes 5
35|CAMPAIGN STYLE — Summer triple milian straw with leather bank,
chin strap and rain cover. Color: Navy.
61/2-77/8 alboum TRIPLE BRIM $75.00 yes 5
36|BALL CAP - SUMMER - 3-6 gold insignias on front of cap, plastic
mesh backs, solid front, adjustable size. Letters should be 2". Letters 3-4 LETTERS
may be made smaller if 5-6 letters are ordered, so that all letters will fit
on front of cap. Colors: Black, Navy Blue. 5.6 LETTERS NO AWARD
37|BALL CAP - WINTER - 3-6 gold insignias on front of cap, solid front
and back, adjustable size. Letters should be 2". Letters may be made 3-4 LETTERS
smaller if 5-6 letters are ordered, so that all letters will fit on front of
cap. 5-6 LETTERS NO AWARD
38|CANVAS TOTE - 100% cotton canvas fabric, 1202, two side pockets
between straps, 23-1/4" x 15-1/2" x 5-1/2", with bottom gusset. Two
heavyweight canvas straps. Color: Navy Blue. CANVAS TOTE toppers 630 $8.00 yes 5
OTHER - Days response time for measurements to an active
agency. $2.00
Days response time for measurements to an passive
agency. $2.00
Days delivery of store stock SIZE to an active
agency. $5.00
Days deliever of factory stock SIZE to an
active/passive agency. $5.00
Days delivery for oversize . $5.00
Number of employed on site Tailors. $10.00
Tailor (s) working hours. 7:00-5:00
Ship Non-Stock days ARO. $30.00
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COMPANY NAME: RWM Embroidery & More
CONTACT NAME: Bob McGinnis
PHONE NUMBER: 302-653-8384
EMAIL ADDRESS: bob@rwmembroidery.com
BRAND DELIVERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE NAME | NUMBER UNIT PRICE IN STOCK IN DAYS
1|TROUSERS - MEN - 65% Dacron/35% Rayon gabardine weave 13-1/2 28-42
oz./linear yard. Plain front, 2 quarter top front pockets, 2 hip pocket, 44-50
straight legs, 3/4" belt loops. Optional 1/2" and 1" leg strips. Colors: 52-54
Navy Blue, Forest Green. 28-40 SHORT RISE
32-42 LONG RISE
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2"
G
11/2"
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2"
G
11/2" NO BID
2|TROUSERS - MEN - 100% Texturized polyester serge weave 11.75 28-42
oz./linear yard. Peak lapels, 5 button, plain front with box pleated patch 44-50
pockets, flaps, shoulder straps and badge tab. 52-54
32-42 LONG RISE
28-40 SHORT RISE
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2"
G
11/2"
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2"
G
11/2" NO BID
3|TROUSERS - MEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton
twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset
pockets, inseam up to 36 inches. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
28-60 Red Kap PT32 28-42-$22.95 N 7
4|TROUSERS - WOMEN — 100% texturized polyester serge weave
11.75 oz./linear yard. Plain front with darts above hip pockets, straignt 6-18
legs, 3/4" belt loops. Optional 1/2" and 1" leg strips. Color: Navy Blue.
20-24
COST TO SEW NYLATWIST BRAID 1/2"
0
11/2"
COST TO SEW SYNTHETIC CLOTH STRIPS 1/2"
0
11/2" NO BID
5|TROUSERS - WOMEN — 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed
cotton twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four
inset pockets, inseam up to 36 inches. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
2-28 Edwards 8610 $25.10 up to 20 N 7
6| TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed
cotton blend or brushed. Double pleated front. Four inset pockets, two
in front, two in rear. Four inch elastic inserts on each side of
waistband. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
2-28 Red Kap PT55 to 20 $17.95 N 7
7|TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed
cotton blend or brushed. Plain front. Four inset pockets, two in front, 2-28 Dickies 92-764 up to 20 $16.95 N 7
8|TROUSERS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz. twill, 65% polyester, 35% combed
cotton blend or brushed. Belt loops, four inset pockets, two in front, two
in rear. Four inch elastic inserts on each side of waistband. Colors:
Navy Blue, Khaki.
2-28 Dickies 92-764 up to 20 $16.95 N 7
9[SHORTS - MEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton twill. 28-60 Edwards 2410 up to 20 $15.95 N 7
Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset
pockets. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki.
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COMPANY NAME:

RWM Embroidery & More

CONTACT NAME:

Bob McGinnis

PHONE NUMBER:

302-653-8384

EMAIL ADDRESS: bob@rwmembroidery.com
BRAND DELIVERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE NAME NUMBER UNIT PRICE IN STOCK IN DAYS
10[SHORTS - MEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton twill.
Solid waistband with belt loops Plain front. Four inset pockets. Colors: 28-60 Red Kap PT26 up to 42 $14.95 N 7
Navy Blue, Khaki.
11|SHORTS - WOMEN - 7-3/4 oz., 65% polyester, 35% brushed cotton
twill. Solid waistband with belt loops. Double pleated front. Four inset
pockets. Colors: Navy Blue, Khaki. 2-28 Edwards 8410 up to 20 $20.45 N 7
12|SKIRT - 100% texturized polyester serge weave 11.75 oz./linear yard.
Slightly flared, 2 side pockets, 4 darts, 3/4" belt loops. Color: Navy 6-18
Blue. 20-24 NO BID
13|SHIRTS - 65% Dacron polyester/35% cotton. 2 pockets w/flaps, badge
tab, 2 shoulder epaulets.
13A
Male Long Sleeve - P877-3 white, P878-3 blue or approved equal. 14-20
13B
Male Short Sleeve - P867-3 white, P868-3 blue or approved equal. 14-20
13C
Female Long Sleeve - P801-3 white, P802-3 blue or approved equal. 32-48
13D
Female Short Sleeve - P811-3 white, P812-3 blue or approved equal. 32-48 NO BID
14|SHIRTS - 100% polyester. 2 pockets with flaps, badge tab, 2 shoulder
epaulets. Shirts can be ordered with contrasting pocket flaps and/or
contrasting epaulets. Epaulets not available on navy blue shirt. Colors:
White, Grey, Silvertan, Blue, Navy Blue, French Blue.
14A|Male Long Sleeve - 300 Series or approved equal. 14-20
14-20 X LONG TAIL
CNTRST PCKTS
14B|Male Short Sleeve - 3300 Series or approved equal. 14-20
14-20 X LONG TAIL
CNTRST PCKTS
14C|Female Long Sleeve - 9300 Series or approved equal. 38-48
CNTRST PCKTS
14D|Female Short Sleeve - 9800 Series or approved equal. 38-48
CNTRST PCKTS NO BID
15|SHIRTS - 65% polyester/35% rayon tropical weave, 2 pockets with
flaps, badge tab, 2 shoulder epaulets. Shirts can be ordered with
contrasting pocket flaps and/or contrasting epaulets. Epaulets not
available on navy blue shirt. Long sleeve shirts may be special ordered
with banjo elbows. Colors: White, Grey, Silvertan, Blue, Navy Blue,
French Blue, Brown.
15A |Male Long Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET
15B |Male Short Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET
15C |Female Long Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET
15D |Female Short Sleeve - 200 Series or approved equal. 14-20
CNTRST PCKT
AND/OR EPAULET NO BID
16|SHIRT - Men - Short sleeve, with buttons, durable press, 65% SXL
polyester, 35% cotton broadcloth, 2 pockets. Color: White. -
2XL-3XL NO AWARD
17|SHIRT - WOMEN - Dress, long sleeve, Cook, 65% polyester, 35%
cotton. Color: White. S-XL Red Kap SP13 $17.95 N 7

10
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COMPANY NAME:

RWM Embroidery & More

CONTACT NAME:

Bob McGinnis

PHONE NUMBER:

302-653-8384

EMAIL ADDRESS: bob@rwmembroidery.com
BRAND DELIVERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE NAME NUMBER UNIT PRICE IN STOCK IN DAYS
18|GOLF SHIRTS - LONG SLEEVE - Unisex - 7 0z., 50% cotton, SQ% XS-XL Port Authority K500ls $18.99 N 7
polyester. One pocket on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve is to -
have three inch cuff. Colors: Lt. Blue, Navy Blue, Tan. 2XL-3XL Port Authority|  K500ls $20.99 N 7
AXL-5XL Port Authority K500Is $24.99 N 7
19|GOLF SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE - Unisex - 7 0z., 50% cotton, 50% )
polyester. One pocket on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve to be XSXL Port Authority] _ KS00P $16.99 N 7
hemmed. Colors: Lt. Blue, Navy Blue, Tan, Royal Blue. 2XL-3XL Port Authority K500P $18.99 N 7
AXL-5XL Port Authority K500P $20.99 N 7
20(GOLF SHIRTS - SHORT SLEEVE - Unisex -100% cotton. One pocket
on left chest, three button closure. Sleeve to be hemmed. Colors: SMXL LERE] 3013 220b X z
Navy, Royal Blue. 2XL-3XL Hartwell 3013 $24.95 N 7
21|BLAZER - MEN - Two button, single breasted, soft shoulder, plain back
with center vent, metal button. 38-48
50-56 NO AWARD
22|CARDIGAN SWEATER - V NECK - 100% no pile acrylic yarn, jersey XS-L
knit fabric, two lower pockets, ribbed waist and cuff. Five button
closure. Color: Navy Blue. XL-2XL
3XL-4XL NO BID
23|EISENHOWER JACKET - MEN - 100% Texturized polyester serge 34-36 REG
weave 11.75 oz./linear yard. Peak lapels, 5 button, plain front with box 38-52 REG
pleated patch pockets, flaps, shoulder straps and badge tab. Color: 36-50 LONG
Navy Blue. 34-46 XLONG NO BID
24|COAT - LADIES - 100% Texturized polyester serge weave 11.75
oz./linear yard. 4-button, single breasted straight front, notched lapels, 6-18
shoulder straps. Color: Navy Blue.
20-24 NO BID
25|TOPPER - WOMEN - Below the hip length, 65% polyester, 35% cotton
with buttons long pointed collar with notched lapel darted bodice and
back, edge stitching enhanced front color, sleeve hems and two slant- SXL REDIKAD 23 $18°40
top lower pockets. Color: White.
2XL-3XL RED Kap TP23 $21.40
26|REVERSIBLE/REFLECTIVE WINDBREAKER - Two-ply 100% nylon
taffeta with reversible bright orange inside shell. Orange side has 1- XS-XL REG
1/2" reflective strips. Zippered front, patch pockets, badge tab, elastic XS-XL LONG
waistband. Colors: Navy/Orange, Black/Orange. =
XXL LONG NO BID
27|COAT- 70 denier nylon. Filling: 3 ply denier nylon. Weight: 3.6 oz. Per S -3XL REG
square yard, weave: plain tear for strength. Gore-Tex liner. Color: Navy S-3XL SHORT
Blue. S- 3XL LONG NO BID
28|CRUISER JACKET WITH GORE-TEX FABRIC — Nylon shell, waist 36-46 REG
length, single breasted, waterproofed with Gore-Tex. Zip outer liner. 48-50 REG
Colors: Police Blue, Black, Brown, O.D. Green. 52-58 REG
36-46 LONG
NO BID
29|BOMBER JACKET (MEN AND WOMEN) — Tasian nylon outer shell,
" - " ] MEDIUM
zip-out full sleeve, thinsulate liner, detachable pile collar, epaulets,
badge tab, knit wristlits and knit waistband, 2 front pockets, zippered LARGE
10" side vents with snap closure. State buttons to be furnished and
sewn on by vendor. Color: Navy. XL
2XL-4XL NO BID
30|JACKET - PILE LINED - UNISEX - Nylon Dupont type 66 Taffeta Shell.
Raglan sleeves, two lower side pockets, drawstring. Machine S-L
washable. Color: Navy Blue.
XL-2XL NO BID

11
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COMPANY NAME: RWM Embroidery & More
CONTACT NAME: Bob McGinnis
PHONE NUMBER: 302-653-8384
EMAIL ADDRESS: bob@rwmembroidery.com
BRAND DELIVERY
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE NAME | NUMBER UNIT PRICE IN STOCK IN DAYS
31|JACKET - Flannel Lined - Unisex - Nylon Dupont type 66 Taffeta Shell.
Raglan sleeves, two lower side pockets, drawstring waist. Jacket has S
gathered sleeve, six (6) snap closures that match shell fabric. Machine
washable. Color: Navy Blue.
XL-3XL NO BID
32|NECKWEAR - 100% polyester. Colors: French Blue, Black, Police CLIP ON STD
Blue, Brown, 3" wide. CLIP ON XLONG
14" SHORT
4 IN HAND STND
4 IN HAND XLONG
CROSS OVER
W/BUTTON SNAP NO BID
33|BELTS - 100% cowhide leather. Plain garrison with solid brass or 28-42
chrome snap on removable buckle. 1-3/4" width. Colors: Black, Brown.
44-50
52-60 NO BID
34|CAMPAIGN STYLE — Winter fur, felt with chin strap and rain cover.
|COIor: Navy. |6 1/2-77/8 NO BID
35|CAMPAIGN STYLE — Summer triple milian straw with leather bank,
chin strap and rain cover. Color: Navy.
61/2-77/8 NO BID
36|BALL CAP - SUMMER - 3-6 gold insignias on front of cap, plastic
mesh backs, solid front, adjustable size. Letters should be 2". Letters 3-4 LETTERS Young An 6002 $6.00
may be made smaller if 5-6 letters are ordered, so that all letters will fit
on front of cap. Colors: Black, Navy Blue. 5.6 LETTERS Young An 6002 $7.00
37|BALL CAP - WINTER - 3-6 gold insignias on front of cap, solid front
and back, adjustable size. Letters should be 2". Letters may be made 3-4 LETTERS Young AN 6003 $6.00
smaller if 5-6 letters are ordered, so that all letters will fit on front of
cap. 5-6 LETTERS Young An 6003 $7.00
38|CANVAS TOTE - 100% cotton canvas fabric, 1202, two side pockets
between straps, 23-1/4" x 15-1/2" x 5-1/2", with bottom gusset. Two
heavyweight canvas straps. Color: Navy Blue. CANVAS TOTE NO BID
OTHER - Days response time for measurements to an active
agency. 3 days
Days response time for measurements to an passive
agency. 3 days
Days delivery of store stock SIZE to an active
agency. 2 days
Days deliever of factory stock SIZE to an
active/passive agency. 7 days
Days delivery for oversize . 7-15 days depends on supplier
Number of employed on site Tailors. 1 tailor
Tailor (s) working hours. 10am-4pm
Ship Non-Stock days ARO. 7 days

12
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