Graham, Michelle Y (Finance)

From: Martin, Tosha (Finance)

Sent: Monday, March 05, 2018 3:20 PM
To: Graham, Michelle Y (Finance)
Subject: FW: RFP# 25-06-01-17-04
Importance: High

From: Martin, Tosha (Finance)

Sent: Thursday, September 07, 2017 8:31 AM

To: Wilson, Chad (Chad.Wilson@navient.com)

Cc: Forte, Mario (Mario.Forte@pioneer-credit.com); Graham, Michelle Y (Finance)
Subject: RFP# 25-06-01-17-04

Importance: High

Chad/Mario,

It is with great pleasure that | announce the awarding of the on-site contract to Pioneer Credit Recovery, Inc.
Congratulations and | look forward to working with you all in the coming years! Please respond confirming your
acceptance so we can move forward with making this official. Have a great day gentlemen!!

Tosha Martin, Manager
Bureau of Tax Collections
Delaware Division of Revenue
302-577-8585




STATE OF DELAWARE
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

DiviSION OF REVENUE

CARVEL STATE BUILDING
820 N. FRENCH STREET
P.O. Box 8763
WILMINGTON, DELAWARE |1 9899-8763

September 21, 2017

Mr. Chad Wilson

Pioneer Credit Recovery, Inc.
26 Edwards Street

Arcade, NY 14009-1012

Dear Mr. Wilson:

Congratulations on your acceptance of the award for the On-Site Professional Collection
Services contract #25-06-01-17-04.

We are in receipt of your performance bond certificate and insurance certification. Thus,
we are returning your bid bond. The new contract is currently being prepared. We will be in
contact with you shortly to begin negotiations.

In the meantime, please don't hesitate to contact me if you have any questions.

Sincerely,

Signature on File

Tosha Martin

Tax Collection Manager
Delaware Division of Revenue
302-577-8585





