State of Delaware

Department of Transportation

1/22/09

SECTION 1 (NORTH AND CANAL DISTRICT)

Iltem Approx
No. Qty
1 500
2 1,050
3 1,000
4 1,000
5 600
6 600
7 150
8 500
9 150
10 150
11 5,700

UOM

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Contract DOT1609-COARSE_AGG

Description

Rice Stone

Quarry Site

GABC

Quarry Site

Rip Rap, R-4
Quarry Site

Rip Rap, R-5
Quarry Site

Rip Rap, R-6
Quarry Site

Rip Rap, R-7
Quarry Site
AASHTO #1 Stone
Quarry Site
Delaware #57 Stone
Quarry Site
Crushed Concrete
Quarry Site

Rice Stone

Quarry Site
Delivery Charge per Ton

Coarse Aggregate
North, Canal and Central

-1-

$10.50
Denver, PA
$6.80
Denver, PA
$11.35
Martindale, PA
$17.00
Denver, PA
$17.50
Denver, PA
$21.60
Schoeneck, PA
$8.15
Martindale, PA
$8.15
Denver, PA
No Bid
$9.00
Denver, PA
$10.64

Vendor Ranking: Contract was awarded on 7/27/16 to vendor NEW ENTERPRISE STONE & LIME CO., INC.

-2
No Bid

$8.00

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD
$14.25

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD
$15.25

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD
$16.25

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD
$17.25

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD
$11.00

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD
$11.00

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD
No Bid

No Bid

$8.24

1 - New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc., 3580 Division Hwy., East Earl, PA 17519
2 - Allan Myers Materials, MD Inc., d/b/a Allan Myers Materials, 638 Lancaster Ave., Malvern, PA 19355

Proposals Received
28-Jun-2016
Page 1



State of Delaware

Department of Transportation

1/22/09

Contract DOT1609-COARSE_AGG

SECTION 2 (CENTRAL DISTRICT)

Item Approx
No. Qty
1 450
2 450
3 450
4 600
5 750
6 450
7 300
8 300
9 450
10 450
11 450
12 300
13 150
14 5,550

UuoOM

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Ton

Description

Rice Stone

Quarry Site

GABC

Quarry Site

Rip Rap, R-4

Quarry Site

Rip Rap, R-5

Quarry Site

Rip Rap, R-6

Quarry Site

Rip Rap, R-7

Quarry Site
AASHTO #1 Stone
Quarry Site
AASHTO #3 Stone
Quarry Site
AASHTO #4 Stone
Quarry Site
Delaware # 57 Stone
Quarry Site
Delaware # 67 Stone
Quarry Site

Crushed Concrete
Quarry Site

Stone Dust

Quarry Site

Delivery Charge per ton

Coarse Aggregate
North, Canal and Central

-1-

$9.00
Denver, PA

$6.80
Denver, PA

$11.35

Martindale, PA

$17.00
Denver, PA

$17.50
Denver, PA

$21.60

Schoeneck, PA

$8.15

Martindale, PA

$8.15

Blue Ball, PA

No Bid
$8.15
Denver, PA
$8.20
Denver, PA
No Bid
$7.00
Denver, PA
$14.88

-2-
No Bid

$8.00

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

$14.25

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

$15.25

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

$16.25

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

$17.25

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

$11.00

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

$11.00

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

No Bid

$11.00

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

No Bid

No Bid

$6.50

Elk Mills Quarry, Elkton, MD

$15.31

1 - New Enterprise Stone & Lime Co., Inc., 3580 Division Hwy., East Earl, PA 17519

2 - Allan Myers Materials, MD Inc., d/b/a Allan Myers Materials, 638 Lancaster Ave., Malvern, PA 19355

Proposals Received
28-Jun-2016
Page 2



