BID TAB SHEET
DOC1324-KITCHEQUIP

TTEM DESCRIPTION TTEM DESCRIPTION TTEM DESCRIPTION TTEM DESCRIPTION TTEM DESCRIPTION TTEM DESCRIPTION
REFRIGERATOR
HEAVY DUTY TRAY PASS-THRU
VENDOR FOOD CUTTER STEAMTABLE DRYING RACK HD CONTINENTAL PASS-THRU
[euns HOBART HEAVY [QTY KETTLE. Gas |9TY THURMADUKE - Qry TYPE MODEL #98354 | Q1Y REFRIGERATOR Ty HEATED CABINET |GRAND TOTAL
DUTY BUFFALO CLEVELAND ELECTRIC EP- NEW AGE MODEL NO. DL2RE- MODEL NO. DL2WE
CHOPPER KGL 80-T 6CBPG/EP-6-CBSS INDUSTRIAL SS-PT-EH-HD §S-PT-HD
AMERICAN ENERGY
RESTAURANT EQUIPMENT LLC
Unit Cosl 1 $9,634.08 1 $27.598.01 1 $6,686.10 1 $2,035,49 1 $11,311,35 1 $10,790.28
Delivery Cost $0 $322.00 $387.90 $401.20 $90.18 $80.72
Total Cost $9,634.08 $27.921.01 $7.074.00 $2,436.69 $11,40153 $10,671.00 $69,338.31
NOTED EXCEFTION S/S NOTED EXCEPTION S/S
Exceplions Noted WALL CLOSURES WALL CLOSURES
PENN JERSEY PAPER CO.
Unit Cost 1 NO BID 1 NO BID 7 NO BID 7 NO BID 1 $12,496.00 1 $11,546.00
Delivery Cosl $900.00 $900.00 _
Total Cosl $13,396.00 $12,446.00 $25,844.00
BID AS GROUP AWARD BID AS GROUP AWARD
Exceptions Noted ONLY ONLY
SAM TELL AND SON INC.
Unit Cost 7 $0,634.06 £ $23,601-55 15 $14,624.55 ES $2.246.23 25 $11.45672 23 31042040
Deiivery Cost $0.00 $0.00 $6-00 $0-00 $0-00 $0.00
Tolal Cost 36,634.06 $23,601.55 $14.624.56 $2,246.23 3945672 $10.420.40 $71,802,23
BID DEEMED NON-CONFORMING. NO BUSINESS
Exceptions Noled REFERENCES AND MISSING FORM F CHECKBOX.
TODD DEVIN FOOD EQUIPMENT
Unit Cosl 1 $9,725.00 1 $21,797.00 1 $7.144.00 1 $2,028.00 1 $11,683.00 1 $10,779.00
Delivery Cost $100.00 $0.00 $0.00 $270.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Cost $9,825.00 $21,797.00 $7,144.00 $2,298.00 $11,683.00 $10,779.00 $63,526,00
Exceplions Noted

| certify the above as true and correct: Erika Martine-Duquette May 28, 2013.




